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NWA SERVE
SAMARITAN COMMUNITY CENTER
Samaritan Community Center is in critical 
need of volunteers. One-third of the SCC’s 
support comes from its thrift stores, so 
volunteers are needed to sort and price 
donated items. To find out more about how 
you can serve, contact Heather at  
479-246-1060.

BELONG
What was your most impressive 
accomplishment as a kid or what is the most 
impressive thing you’ve ever heard about a 
kid doing? 

GROW 
2 CHRONICLES 34:1 says that Josiah 
became king at age 8. What challenging 
situation did you have to overcome as a kid 
and who helped you face this challenge?

2 CHRONICLES 34:3 tells us how old Josiah 
was when he began to seek the Lord. We’re 
also told about the subsequent decisions 
that he began making in his leadership. At 
what age did you begin to follow the Lord 
and what changes occurred in your life?

2 CHRONICLES 34:19 shows Josiah’s strong 
response to hearing God’s Word spoken. 
Do you remember a time when a verse or 
passage of Scripture hit you hard? What 
was the verse or passage? What struck you 
about it, and what was your response?  

2 CHRONICLES 34:27 gives us a clear 
picture of the type of attitude that 
impresses the Lord. Read I Peter 5:5 as a 
parallel New Testament passage. How do 
you define humility? Who is one of the most 
humble people you know? Describe what 
humility looks like in their life. 

Generosity is a clear theme of 
2 CHRONICLES 35:7-9. What are some 
recent examples of generosity you have 
seen or heard about? What are some 
common attributes you’ve noticed about 
generous people? How do you want to be 
more generous?  

2 CHRONICLES 35:18 tells us a shocking 
fact about how long the leaders of Israel 
had half-heartedly observed one of the 
most central spiritual practices in Israel’s 
worship. What are the spiritual practices you 
regularly engage in during your worship of 
the Lord? What happens in your life when 
you neglect these disciplines? 

THIS WEEK 
KING JOSIAH

CONNECT IN WORD

DAY ONE
Josiah Restores
2 Chronicles 34:1-13

DAY TWO
The Book Of 

The Law Found
2 Chronicles 34:14-22

DAY THREE 
Prophetic 

Pronouncement 
And Israel’s Response

2 Chronicles 34:23-33

DAY FOUR
The Passover Restored 

To Israel
2 Chronicles 35:1-19

DAY FIVE 
Josiah’s Death  

And Legacy
2 Chronicles 35:20-27
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